
RE: Invoice for modern portable weigh scales Trial -
4200034430
From: WALKER Paul R <paul.walker@rms.nsw.gov.au>
To: SOLIMAN Samer <samer.soliman@rms.nsw.gov.au>
Date: Mon, 15 Jan 2018 10:32:20 +1100

Hi Samer,

This hasn’t been workflowed  to me yet.

Regards,

Paul

From: SOLIMAN Samer 
Sent: Monday, 15 January 2018 10:17 AM
To: WALKER Paul R
Subject: RE: Invoice for modern portable weigh scales Trial - 4200034430

Did you do the goods receipting for this mate? Let me know if you need some help in case you
haven’t done it before

Samer Soliman 
Manager Heavy Vehicle Programs

From: SOLIMAN Samer 
Sent: Wednesday, 10 January 2018 10:17 AM
To: WALKER Paul R
Subject: Re: Invoice for modern portable weigh scales Trial - 4200034430

Hi mate,
Yes this is good to approve once it comes to your workflow. 

Cheers,
Samer

On 10 Jan 2018, at 9:03 am, WALKER Paul R <Paul.WALKER@rms.nsw.gov.au> wrote:

Hi Samer,

I’ve received this invoice from AZH Consulting.

Regards,

Paul Walker
Technical Officer, Environment | Heavy Vehicle Programs
Compliance Monitoring | Compliance Branch | Compliance and Regulatory Services
T 02 8848 8247 M 0412 256 198
www.rms.nsw.gov.au 
Every journey matters

Roads and Maritime Services
Suite 6F, Level 6 110 George Street Parramatta NSW 2150
PO Box 3035 Parramatta NSW 2124
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From: AZH Consulting [mailto:manager@azhconsulting.com.au] 
Sent: Tuesday, 9 January 2018 9:26 PM
To: TSS Invoices
Cc: WALKER Paul R
Subject: Invoice for modern portable weigh scales Trial - 4200034430
 
Hi There,
 
Please find attached invoice RMS15 for  4200034430.
 
Thanks
 
--
Zoe Hamidi
Director
+61 481 137 516
P.O. BOX 235, Castle Hill, NSW, 1765
Manager@AZHConsulting.com.au

This email may be confidential. If you received it accidentally, please delete it and let the sender know straight away so it won’t
happen again. Please do not disclose this email to anyone else without the sender’s permission. We do our best to avoid
errors on emails, but occasionally we do make mistakes, so we can’t warrant this email will be error free. And before you go,
please note that we might scan, store, read or disclose to others, any emails sent to or from AZH Consulting PTY LTD at our
discretion.

Please think of the environment before printing this email.

<INVOICE-RMS15.pdf>
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